
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Seal Beach Police Department 
911 Seal Beach Boulevard, Seal Beach, CA 90740 

 
January 9, 2024     Contact: Captain Nick Nicholas  

(562) 799-4100 ext. 1160 
FOR IMMEDIATE RELEASE   nnicholas@sealbeachca.gov 
     

THE CITY OF SEAL BEACH ANNOUNCES PUBLIC HEARING TO CONSIDER 

PROPOSED RATES FOR ANIMAL LICENSING FEES 
 
Seal Beach, CA – To keep pace with inflation and the rising costs of providing safe, 
reliable, and effective animal control services, the City of Seal Beach is considering 
adopting a proposed resolution updating and establishing user and regulatory fees for 
animal control services, including dog licensing fees. 
 
The public hearing will be held on Monday, January 22, 2024, at 7:00 pm at the Seal 
Beach City Council Chambers located at 211 8th Street, Seal Beach, CA 90740. 
Following the public hearing, the City Council will consider a proposed resolution to 
adopt the fees for animal control services, including dog licensing.  This fee schedule 
will become effective upon adoption. 
 
All interested persons are invited to attend and speak on this matter.  Documents 
regarding the proposed fees, including the resolution and staff report, are on file and 
available for public review and may be accessed via the City Clerk’s Office at City Hall, 
211 8th Street, Seal Beach, CA 90740. For further information regarding the proposed 
fees, please contact Captain Nick Nicholas of the Seal Beach Police Department at 
(562) 799-4100. 
 
Members of the public may submit written comments on the matters to be considered in 
this public hearing via email to the City Clerk at gharper@sealbeachca.gov. All 
comments should be received before the start of the meeting, and all comments will be 
distributed to the City Council.  The City will provide an opportunity for members of the 
public to provide public testimony to the City Council during the public hearing. If 
anyone wishes to challenge the City Council’s action in court, they may be limited to 
raising only those issues they or anyone else raised at the public hearing described in 
this notice or in written correspondence delivered to the City Clerk’s Office at, or prior to, 
the public hearing. 
 
The meeting is open to the public and will be available to be viewed online.  For more 
information, refer to https://www.sealbeachca.gov/Government/Agendas-Notices-
Meeting-Videos.   
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